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The sunset opposite Nanaimo is glorious. To the east the water was a rose lavender, 

the sky at the horizon blue, eight or ten degrees above a red purple. In the west 

gold and purple on horizontal bars of cloud, shading off into lilac. Islands dark purple. 

-John Muir, Journal (June 1, 1899, excursion to Alaska)' 

Nobody of any real culture ... ever talks nowadays about the beauty of a sunset. 
Sunsets are quite old-fashioned. They belong to the time when Turner was the last 

note in art. To admire them is a distinct sign of provincialism of temperament. Upon 

the other hand they go on. Yesterday evening Mrs. Arundel insisted on my going to 
the window, and looking at the glorious sky, as she called it. Of course I had to look 

at it .... And what was it? It was simply a very second-rate Turner, a Thrner of a bad 

period, with all the painter's worst faults exaggerated and over-emphasized. 

-Oscar Wilde, The Decay ofLying: An Observation (1889)2 

Introductjon 

T he beauty of the environment pro­
vides significant motivation for 
protecting it. Whether it is pre­

serving wilderness areas, protecting. the 
rural countryside from sprawl, or oppos­
ing the cutting down of a neighborhood 
tree, environmental beauty is a prominent 
concern. I believe that aesthetic consider­
ations can help justify environmental 
protection as well. I call such aesthetic de­
fenses of the environment aesthetic pro­

tectionism. Environmental degradation is 
a serious problem in large part because it 
involves the destruction of substantial 
aesthetic value. Indeed, if wilderness, the 
rural countryside, and neighborhood 
trees had little aesthetic value (or negative 
aesthetic value), both the practice of­
and justification for-environmental pro­
tection would be seriously weakened .. 

There are many reasons not to make 
aesthetics central to defending the envi­
ronment. Many consider natural beauty 
to be a weak and trivial value compared 
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with the utilitarian values used either to 
protect the environment (for example, 
health and recreation) or to exploit it (for 
example, jobs and growth). Gary Varner 
suggests that natural beauty is at best a 
tiebreaker: 

An attempt to justify a ban on logging in the 
Pacific Northwest's remaining old-growth 
forests solely in terms of these forests' special 
beauty would be on very shaky ground if the 
ban would cause economic dislocation of 
thousands of loggers and mill workers .... It 
is only in this context (i.e., other things being 
equal) that aesthetic considerations seem 
compelling.3 

Others have argued that because natural 
beauty counts for little when determining 
how we should treat humans, we should 
be skeptical that it amounts to much in 
determining how we should treat the 
environment.4 Many people think that 
aesthetic value is anthropocentric and in­
strumental (that is, a value reducible to 
pleasurable experiences for humans) and 
that the best defenses of nature should be 
intrinsic. 

Perhaps the most important worry 
about aesthetic defenses of the 
environment-and the focus of this 
essay-is the common assumption that 
beauty is in the eye of the beholder and 
therefore that aesthetic responses are sub­
jective and relative. If judgments of envi­
ronmental beauty lack objective grounding, 
they seemingly provide a poor basis for 
justifying environmental protection. One 
legal analysis early in the environmental 
movement describes this concern well: 

[There is a] common judicial belief that 
aesthetic evaluations and standards are a 

matter of individual taste, which varies from 
person to person, and are thus too subjec­
tive to be applied in any but an arbitrary 
and capricious manner .... One person's 
judgment on aesthetic matters is as good as 
another's ... no aesthetic judgment is more 
or less reasonable than any other .... Any 
aesthetic regulation would simply impose 
one person's taste on another who legiti­
mately holds a different viewpoint. 5 

One of the first philosophers to note this 
problem contended that 

If beauty in nature or art is merely in the 
eye of the beholder, then no general moral 
obligation arises out of aesthetic judg­
ments.... A judgment of value that is 
merely personal and subjective gives us no 
way of arguing that everyone ought to learn 
to appreciate something, or at least regard it 
as worthy of preservation.!' 

Even if we reject the view that aesthetic 
judgments are generally subjective and rel­
ative, we may think that judgments about 
environmental beauty are subjective and 
relative. A common view in the philosophy 
of art is that even though art is substan­
tially objective, the aesthetic appreciation 
of nature is either thoroughly relative or 
much less constrained than the aesthetic 
appreciation of art.? Consider the follow­
ing statement of this view from a highly re­
garded introductory aesthetic textbook: 

A great mountain (Mt. Fuji, Grand Teton) 
would probably strike us as noble and 
strong, or expressive of nobility and 
strength, but it is perfectly conceivable that 
it might strike an observer from an alien 
culture as comical or agonized. In the case 
of a natural object, such as a mountain, 
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such relativity of perception is no real 
problem, because the mountain itself isn't 
really noble or comical. We can only say 
that there are different ways to regard the 
mountain.... It is harder to swallow such 
relativism when it comes to the expressive 
properties of artworks.... What I am 
suggesting is that the emotional qualities 
that artworks express are not dispensable 
facts about them, although the emotional 
qualities are dispensable facts about natural 
objects.... Edvard Munch's The Scream is 
truly frightening .... The fact that The 
Scream might strike a viewer from another 
culture as cheerful ... should not make us 
think that The Scream is a cheerful paint­
ing.... There is no real fact of the matter 
about whether Mount Fuji is noble or 
whether it is comical.8 

Although in this passage John Fisher lim­
its his comments to the expressive features 
of natural objects, others have extended 
this claim of subjectivity and relativity to 
other aesthetic properties ofnature and to 
judgments about natural beauty in general. 
Such relativism seems to be problematic 
for those hoping to use the environment's 
aesthetic value to support environmental 
protection. 

In the almost fifty-year-long dispute 
over protecting Alaska's Arctic National 
Wildlife Refuge from oil development-al­
though there clearly are other issues at 
stake-the aesthetic value ofthe refuge has 
figured prominently. Former U.S. Interior 
Secretary Gail Norton regards the refuge 
as a "Godforsaken mosquito-infested 
swamp shrouded in frozen darkness half 
the year," whereas former U.S. President 
Jimmy Carter judges it to be a place of"sol­
itude, unmatched beauty, and grandeur." 
If these aesthetic judgments are merely 

matters of personal taste, one neither bet­
ter nor worse than the other, then the aes­
thetic character of the refuge cannot playa 
legitimate role in determining its fate. 

Or consider this example: A commu­
nity wanting to preserve its rural character 
argues that great aesthetic value will be 
lost when its tranquil tree-lined roads, in­
terspersed with farmhouses, small fields, 
and ponds-symbolic ofhuman harmony 
with nature-are replaced with an aggres­
sive, cluttered, and gaudy strip-highway 
sprawl of auto dealers, gas stations, and 
parking lots, so symbolic of our society's 
careless exploitation and disregard of the 
natural world. In response, the develop­
ers maintain that the elimination of the 
monotonous weed-infested dirt roads 
and their replacement with useful and 
well-built stores will offer great aesthetic 
value and express and reward hard work, 
determination, and entrepreneurial in­
genuity. Environmental aesthetics needs 
some type of objectivity if it is to help us 
adjudicate between developers who like 
strip malls and environmentalists who 
do not. Without some ability to distin­
guish between better and worse aesthetic 
responses, the appeal to aesthetie consid­
erations has little use in environmental 
decision making. 

In this essay I explore the debate be­
tween objectivity and relativity in envi­
ronmental aesthetics. I examine arguments 
for relativism offered by John Fisher and 
Malcolm Budd and assess the implications 
of these arguments for aesthetic protec­
tionism. This essay also considers diverse 
arguments for objectiyity proposed by Al­
len Carlson, Noel Carroll, and Emily 
Brady. My purpose in examining the de­
bate between relativity and objectivity in 
environmental aesthetics is to determine 
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the extent to which this debate matters to 
aesthetic protectionism. Does environ­
mental aesthetic relativism really under­
mine the use of environmental beauty 
for environmental protection? Does the 
objectivity provided by the objectivists 
allow aesthetics to be useful to debates 
over environmental protection? llook at 
Marcia Eaton's suggestion that a cogni­
tive view like Allen Carlson's is necessary 
if environmental aesthetics is to "con­
tribute to preserving sustainable land­
scapes" and criticize her assumption that 
nature will necessarily be better pro­
tected by aesthetic responses based on a 
knowledge of-rather than an ignorance 
of-nature.9 I propose that we adopt a 
"constrained pluralism" in environmen­
tal aesthetics that falls between the ex­
tremes of subjectivity and objectivity and 
argue that there is a mUltiplicity of better 
and worse aesthetic responses to the 
environment. 

Objectivity as Constrained Pluralism: 
Better and Worse Aesthetic Responses 
to Nature 

Carlson's views have been central to the 
debate over aesthetic responses to nature. lO 

He brings objectivity to environmental 
aesthetics by arguing that environmental 
aesthetic appreciation (and judgment) 
should respond to what the aesthetic object 
is rather than what it is not. He argues that 
because science is our best guide to the na­
ture of the natural world, an aesthetic re­
sponse to nature should be guided by a 
knowledge of science or natural history 
more generally (much as an aesthetic re­
sponse to art should be guided by a knowl­
edge of art history). Because science is 
objective, an environmental aesthetic in­

formed by science will be objective as 
well. 

Many people disagree with Carlson's 
scientific monism and argue that accept­
able nature appreciation can be'guided by 
emotional, imaginative, or other cognitive 
resources besides science. Rejecting scien­
tific monism need not mean that nature 
can be aesthetically appreciated in any ar­
bitrary way one wants. To deny that there 
is only one correct type of response to an 
environmental aesthetic object-or to na­
ture more generally-is not to accept that 
all aesthetic responses (or types of aes­
thetic response) are equally good. Carl­
son's science-based appreciation of nature 
is not the only position that allows for ob­
jectivity, nor-as we shall see-is aesthetic 
protectionism always best served by a sci .. 
entifically informed aesthetic response. 

Carlson frequently insists that the "ap­
propriate" or "correct" or "true" aesthetic 
appreciation of nature must be guidtd by 
science. Therefore, aesthetic responses to 
nature not informed by science or natural 
history must be "inappropriate," "incor­
rect," or even "false."ll But I believe that it 
is not helpful to confine our assessment of 
aesthetic responses to nature to choices 
like "correct or incorrect," "true or false," 
or even "appropriate or inappropriate." 
We need many more criteria to determine 
better and worse in aesthetic responses to 
nature, criteria that are contextually sen­
sitive and not rigidly hierarchical. Con­
sider that a scientifically uniformed 
aesthetic response may in fact be accept­
able. For example, even though a child or 
an uneducated adult may not know that a 
glacier is a river of ice, there is nothing in­
correct, false, or even inappropriate about 
their being impressed by the sight of a 
calving glacier. Nonetheless, informed re­
sponses often are better responses. Knowl­

" 
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edge about the nature of glaciers can 
broaden our response to them. For exam­
ple, we might begin to listen for and hear 
the groaning of the ice as it scrapes down 
the valley. 

I believe the most plausible position on 
objectivity in environmental aesthetic ap­
preciation is a "constrained pluralism" 
that permits many better and worse aes­
thetic responses to environment and that 
distinguishes between better and worse in 
a variety of ways (and not simply as cor­
rect or incorrect, true or false, based on 
science or not based on science, or appro­
priate or inappropriate)P Constrained 
pluralism falls between a naive monism 
that insists on uniquely correct and ap­
propriate aesthetic responses to the envi­
ronment and an "anything-goes 
subjectivism" that regards all aesthetic re­
sponses to the environment to be equally 
validP We shall see that such a view has 
sufficient objectivity to be useful to aes­
thetic protectionism. 

To my knowledge, everyone working in 
environmental aesthetics distinguishes 
between better and worse responses to 
environment,I4 including thinkers with 
drastically divergent approaches to aes­
thetics from science-based (cognitive) 
theorists like Carlson to emotional-arousal 
theorists like Carroll and imagination­
based theorists like Brady. Ronald Hep­
burn has discussed how we might think 
about better and worse aesthetic responses 
to nature without being constrained by 
naive realist-sounding phrases like "the 
correct or true way" to appreciate na­
ture.IS Hepburn focuses on the difference 
between a "trivial and serious" aesthetic 
appreciation of nature, but I think it im­
portant to appeal to additional distinc­
tions between better and worse ways to 
appreciate environments. I6 

Consider the difference between deep 
versus shallow or superficial responses: In 
his critique of Carlson's scientific mo­
nism, Carroll suggests that depth in an 
aesthetic response might include either 
the length of time that a response can 
continue or the intensity of the response's 
involvement at one time. I7 The so-cilled 
scenery cult is an excellent example of a 
shallow appreciation of nature. A well­
developed literature criticizes the inabil­
ity of many people to appreciate unscenic 
nature as being an aesthetic vice.I8 For too 
many people, nature appreciation is lim­
ited to appreciating nature's dramatic 
landscapes. For them, nature appreciation 
means driving though a national par~ 
stopping only at scenic viewpoints for 
snapshots and gift shops for picture post­
cards of the scenery. This is a lazy type of 
nature appreciation interested only in 
"easy beauty" and the "picturesque" and 
in visual appreciation rather than a 
deeper, multisensuous engagement. This 
critique suggests that the better aesthetic 
responses involve more senses than just 
sight.I9 Better responses are lively and ac­
tive (perceptually and otherwise), rather 
than feeble and passive.2PContrast appre­
ciating a mountain lake by gazing at it 
from the shoreline with appreciating the 
lake while swimming in it. Or compare 
watching through a window with experi­
encing a storm while being outside in the 
midst of it.21 

Discriminating responses are better 
than undiscriminating ones. Attentive re­
sponses are better than inattentive ones 
or inappropriately attentive responses (for 
example, those people who are so focused 
on finding a particular flower that they 
miss the aesthetic qualities of the forest at 
large). Mature responses are better than 
immature ones; unbiased responses are 
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better than biased ones. Consider the self­
indulgent response that appreciates a 
rainbow as "placed here just for me!" Pa­
tient and careful responses are better than 
hasty ones; perceptive responses are bet­
ter than confused ones. Thoughtful and 
reflective responses are better than un­
thinking ones, such as the stereotypical 
response to deer as cute and reminiscent 
of Bambi. Knowledgeable responses are 
better than ones that distort, ignore, or 
suppress important truths about the ob­
jects of appreciation.22 Consider, for ex­
ample, the romanticized appreciation of 
wolves that ignores their predatory life­
style. Or consider the aesthetic judgment 
of the English poet John Donne about 
mountains, based on the seventeenth­
century view that God originally made 
the world a smooth sphere but then de­
formed it in punishment for human sins: 
"Warts, and pock-holes on the face of 
th'earth."23 

Some aesthetic judgments of nature are 
indeed true or false, correct or incorrect, 
appropriate or not, but many aesthetic re­
sponses to nature are better or worse than 
others on very different grounds. Accord­
ingly, we should not assume that there is 
only one legitimate type of aesthetic ap­
preciation of the environment (as if this 
were necessary for aesthetic protection­
ism). Nor should we feel forced into the 
belief that any type of aesthetic response 
to and judgment about the environment 
is acceptable. Instead, we should be open 
to a plurality of types of response to na­
ture, some of which are better or worse 
than others. It is my contention that such 
a critical pluralism is sufficiently objec­
tive to make the aesthetic appreciation of 
nature a serious and worthwhile activity 
and one that enables viable aesthetic 
protectionism.24 

Arguments for Relativity in 
Environmental Aesthetics 

Next I consider the views of those who 
doubt the objectivity of environmental 
appreciation and argue for relativity in 
environmental aesthetics. Their principal 
argument is that nature appreciation lacks 
the kind ofobjectivity found in art appre­
ciation and that the appreciation of art is 
far more constrained than the apprecia­
tion of nature. I examine whether this al­

~ 

leged deficiency in objectivity exists and 
consider whether it is a problem for aes­
thetic protectionism. 

John Fisher defends the value of aes­
thetically appreciating the sounds of na­
ture while arguing that such appreciation 
is far more relative than the appreciation 
of music.25 Although he does not argue 
that we can generalize his analysis of the . ' 
relativity of aesthetic judgments about 
nature's sounds to judgments about other 
natural features, I see little reason to be­
lieve that his arguments apply only to the 
appreciation of nature's sounds. In fact, 
Malcolm Budd presents similar argu­
ments for the relativity of environmental 
aesthetics responses in general. 26 

Fisher distinguishes between two di­
mensions of objectivity. The first is that 
all aesthetic appreciation, including na­
ture appreciation, should be guided by the 
aesthetic object ("guidance-by-object re­
quirement") and the second is the "agree­
ment criterion," according to which 
aesthetic judgments are universal in that, 
proper aesthetic judgments are true andy 
require agreement from other perceivers 

:~ 

who are sensitive, rational, and appropri­
ately placed.27 Fisher accepts the first and 
rejects the second and argues that agree­
ment does not follow from the guidance­
by-object criterion becaU$e an aesthetic 
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response can be guided by an object's 
characteristics at the same time it is un­
derdetermined by them. Although he 
thinks this underdetermination is also 
true of the appreciation of art objects, 
aesthetic judgments of nature's sounds 
"will be many times more underdeter­
mined than are typical judgments of art 
or musical works."28 

Malcolm Budd agrees that an aesthetic 
appreciation of nature has a freedom and 
relativity that an appreciation of art does 
not have: "The aesthetic appreciation of 
nature is thereby endowed with a freedom 
denied to artistic appreciation."29 Fisher 
notes that unlike artworks (including 
music), natural sounds are not intentional 
objects created to be appreciated in cer­
tain ways. This fact leads him to conclude 
that "the person who listens to nature is 
simply free of the criteria that govern ap­
preciation of music and that function to 
rule out many possible ways of listen­
ing."30 Budd makes the same claim about 
the appreciation of nature in general: Na­
ture appreciation, he argues, is looser than 
art appreciation because nature was not 
designed for the purpose of aesthetic ap­
preciation; and thus its appreciation is re­
leased from the kinds of constraints that 
such design places on art appreciation.31 

For example, cubist paintings are not in­
tended to be judged in terms oftheir repre· 
sentational accuracy, and to judge them 
in this way is a mistake. In contrast, na­
ture does not intend us to appreciate it in 
one way or another. 

That artists design art objects for aes­
thetic appreciation may well constrain the 
proper appreciation of artworks in ways 
that nature appreciation is not con­
strained. The truth ofthis claim, however, 
depends on accepting particular theories 
ofart. It is not clear that formalists would 

assent to it, and the claim assumes a sig­
nificance for artists' intentions that anti­
intentionalists may reject. Even ifwe grant 
the claim (as I do), it is arguable that in­
tentional design not only constrains the 
appropriate aesthetic response but also 
opens avenues for new interpretations and 
types of appreciative responses. There 
may well be a greater number ofappropri­
ate appreciative responses to Marcel Du­
champ's Fountain than there were to that 
toilet when it was sitting in a warehouse. 
Or consider the difference between ap­
preciating a moose and appreciating a 
painting of a moose. The painting of a 
moose would have all sorts of meanings 
that a moose itself does not (of course, the 
moose in nature also has meanings that 
the painting would not have). The inter­
pretation and evaluation of a moose 
painting involve issues of artistic intent 
and style, and the cultural context of the 
painting both constrains and complicates 
its appreciation. The lack ofartistic intent 
regarding the object of nature apprecia­
tion removes some of its complexity, 
which may actually limit the number of 
appropriate responses to it. 32 

Both Fisher and Bud4 note the relative 
lack of framing in nature compared with 
art. Nature does not come with a frame 
around it (as does a painting and artworks 
more generally), and there are many dif­
ferent and legitimate ways to frame it. 
Unlike art, in which the artist (or the art 
category) frames the aesthetic object, the 
appreciator chooses how to frame the aes­
thetic experience of nature. For example, 
we do not look at the hack ofa painting or 
tap it to see how it sounds, even though 
these are permissible approaches to ap­
preciating a natural object like a tree. 
Budd argues that-in contrast to art 
appreciation-there is no proper level of 
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observation for nature. We can look at na­
ture though a telescope or a microscope 
or with our unaided eyes. He also argues 
that there are no proper or optimal condi­
tions for observation: we can observe na­
ture when it is foggy or clear, bright or 
dark, from near or far. Budd also claims 
that we may use any sense modality or 
mode of perception: We can choose to 
look, hear, touch, taste, or smell natural 
objects. In general, Budd contends, we are 
free to frame nature as we please. Thus 
"there is no such thing as the appropriate 
aesthetic appreciation of nature" (as there 
is with art).33 This is because "the range 
of its aesthetic properties or aesthetically 
relevant appearances ... [are) typically 
indefinite and open-ended in a manner 
uncharacteristic of works of art."34 Budd 
concludes that the attempt to find a model 
of nature appreciation that tells us "what 
is to be appreciated and how it is to be 
appreciated-something we have a good 
grasp of in the case of works of art" is "a 
chimerical quest."35 

Although these claims have some va­
lidity, they clearly are problematic as well. 
Budd overstates the freedom involved be­
cause he overlooks constraints on how we 
may frame the appreciation of natural ob­
jects. Once we settle on a particular natu­
ral object as the object of our aesthetic 
attention, we rule out many other fram­
ing choices. For example, we should not 
appreciate trout swimming in a mountain 
stream with a telescope or a microscope; 
there are better and worse levels of obser­
vation in such cases. Aesthetically appre­
ciating a cliff is not best done from an 
airplane six miles high or from a mobile 
home on a pitch black night; there are 
better and worse conditions of observa­
tion. Are we really free to use any of our 
senses to appreciate a mountain? Glenn 

Parsons notes that "smell, touch and tasw:rZ 
require close proximity and mountains~':o'l 
are generally not the sort of things we can} 
feel or taste; at best one can feel or taste)'; 
one small part of a mountain."36 , 

Fisher claims that how we frame nature':~ 
is partially arbitrary: "One can, of cours~ i; 
choose principles of framing, but I do not,.Z: 
see how they could fail to be partially ar..,'( 
bitrary, even if natural in one respect or . 
another."3? Fisher argues-again in cott'.! ' 
trast to musical appreciation-that tilt 
appreciation of natural sounds lacks in-; 
stitutional conventions that determine 
and guide appropriate appreciation. So' 
besides there being no artist to frame the 
aesthetic object, there also are no social 
conventions to help frame the apprecia,. 
tion of nature (natural sounds) as there 
are for artworks (music). 

I see no way to raise the status of my 
framing to that required to make my 
judgments objective without claiming that " 
we have conventions-not just typical or 
understandable responses-for listening to 
the sounds of nature.... [This] would not 
be a plausible claim about acts of listening 
to nature in our society.38 

There are no nature (natural sound) 
critics in the mold ofart (music) criticS.39 

Thus Fisher argues that what we should 
listen to in nature, for how long, and in 
what way are generally choices we can 
make freely. He illustrates framing rela· 
tivity with the following examples: 

Suppose you are sitting in a hot tub in a city 
in the Arizona desert listening to the sounds 
around you. Do you just listen to the 
Western Warblers and the wind in the fruit 
and palm trees or do you (should you) also 
notice the sounds of hot tub jets and 
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popping bubbles making a pleasant hissing 
on the water? Do you add or ignore the 
sounds of ventilator fans spinning hot air 
from the attics and occasional jet planes 
overhead? At Niagara Falls do I strain to 
hear birds in the forest over the constant 
roar of the water .... In the Tuscan country­
side do I ignore the high pitched whining of 
mosquitoes? Shall I just focus on the loons 
from across the lake in Minnesota or shall I 
strain to hear others from more distant 
parts, and do they go together with the 
chattering ofsquirrels and the buzzing of 
flies?40 

"Nature does not dictate an intrinsically 
correct way to frame its sounds in the way 
that a composer does," and "there is a 
large multiplicity of structures and rela­
tions that we might hear and all seem 
equally legitimate."41 

I think Fisher and Budd have made a 
good case for framing pluralism in regard 
to aesthetic responses to environmental 
sounds and beauty more generally. The 
aesthetic appreciator clearly has great 
freedom (and, in many ways, greater free­
dom than with artworks) in framing the 
experience of nature's sounds and its 
other aesthetic objects, and this results in 
a multiplicity of appropriate appreciative 
acts and judgments. Fisher and Budd are 
right that there is not only one correct 
way to frame and aesthetically appreciate 
nature. 

Does this plurality of appropriate aes­
thetic responses to the environment pres­
ent a problem for aesthetic protectionism? 
We might not think so, as the aesthetic 
freedom to focus on one loon or forty-or 
to listen to the wind in the trees alone or 
along with the warblers-would seem to 
have little relevance to using environmen­
tal beauty for policy. Whether I look at 

mountain through the fog in. the early 
morning light or during the middle oftilt 
afternoon on a perfectly clear' day or 
whether I concentrate on the smell of the 
mountain's spruce trees after the rain or 
savor the taste of its wild huckleberries 
does not seem to threaten aesthetic pro­
tectionism. If all the many acceptable 
ways to appreciate nature were aestheti­
cally positive and of greater value than 
what would replace them as a result ofen­
vironmental degradation, then pluralism 
would not compromise aesthetic protec­
tionism. Furthermore, acknowledging the 
multiplicity of acceptable ways to frame 
and appreciate nature is compatible with 
judging there to be a multiplicity of incor­
rect ways to do this as well (and both 
Fisher and Budd give us some grounds for 
making such judgments). 

Nonetheless, certain kinds ofpluralism 
in environmental aesthetic response can 
be a serious problem for aesthetic protec­
tionism. Let us start with framing relativ­
ity: Just how arbitrary is the framing 
choice supposed to be? Specifically, does 
the freedom to frame apply to whether or 
not human sounds or other human ef­
fects should be part ofqur appreciation of 
a natural environment? Should human 
intrusions be included in our apprecia­
tion of the environment? If there are no 
better or worse ways to frame these aes­
thetic responses, then we have a problem 
with using typical environmentalist judg­
ments about natural beauty to protect the 
environment. 

Consider the following environmental 
policy disputes: Should airplanes be al­
lowed to fly over the Grand Canyon? 
Should helicopters be allowed to trans­
port hikers into remote areas of Alaska's 
Denali National Park? Is snowmobiling in 
Yellowstone in the winter acceptable, and 
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is it compatible with cross-country ski­
ing? Should a developer be allowed to put 
an automobile racetrack next to a cypress­
swamp nature preserve? In each of these 
cases, environmentalists have argued that 
engine noises degrade the natural tran­
quillity and substantially lessen the area's 
aesthetic value. But if the framing of 
sounds is arbitrary, then antienvironmen­
talists can insist that such intrusive hu­
man sounds be framed out of the 
experience. The developer can ask those 
listening for owls in the swamp to ignore 
the sounds of the nearby Friday-night 
races. Yellowstone skiers can be asked to 
frame out the stench and whine of snow­
mobiles. Hikers in the national parks 
can simply ignore the buzz of aircraft 
overhead. A similar argument can be 
made concerning other human intru­
sions into nature. The developer can ask 
those hiking in the forest to ignore the 
trophy homes on the ridgetops. And if 
there are no better or worse ways to frame 
these aesthetic experiences, why shouldn't 
they? 

One response is to claim that we may 
be unable to frame out these human in­
trusions, at least not without special psy­
chological training. But the deeper claim 
is that we should not frame them out, at 
least not in our overall assessment of the 
aesthetic value of these environments. 
Such an assessment must include these 
sounds, smells, and sights. An aesthetic 
response to and an evaluation of environ­
ments that suppress these sensual proper­
ties is aesthetically impoverished. To use 
some of the earlier distinctions, such a re­
sponse would be superficial, inattentive, 
biased, and/or distorted. In these cases, it 
is fitting and natural to include-and 
even focus on-these human-caused sen­
sual intrusions in our assessment of the 

overall aesthetic value of these environ­
ments. To ignore them would be like 
standing in Wyoming's Snake River valley 
and refusing to look to the west. This 
would not be an acceptable way to aes­
thetically appreciate Grand Teton Na­
tional p.ark. Aesthetic judgments about 
environments that frame out human in­
trusions are similarly distorting. A devel­
oper who insists that putting a skyscraper 
in the Snake River valley will not detract 
from the aesthetic beauty of the valley 
and the neighboring Grand Teton Na­
tional Park because "one can simply frame 
it out" is relying on a mistaken concep­
tion of the freedom of framing choices in 
environmental appreciation. Do Fisher's 
and Budd's accounts of framing freedom 
and relativity justify this antienviron­
mentalist argument? I hope not. 

What accounts for the intuitively plau­
sible judgment that such a framing choice 
is not legitimate? One possibility is to ap­
peal to the ideas of natural salience and 
natural framing. Carroll uses these ideas 
to explain how "being moved by nature" 
(that is, an aesthetic-emotional arousal to 
nature) can solve the problem ofaesthetic 
focus. 

Certain natural expanses have natural 
frames or what I prefer to call natural 
closure: caves, copses, grottoes, clearings, 
arbors, valleys, etc. And other natural 
expanses, though lacking frames, have 
features that are naturally salient for human 
organisms-Le., they have features such as 
moving water, bright illumination, etc. that 
draw our attention instinctually toward 
themY 

The loud roar of engines or a towering 
skyscraper rising from a valley and 
blocking the view of a mountain will 
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naturally draw our aesthetic attention, 
and it is awkward and forced to appreci­
ate these environments while trying to 
ignore these human intrusions or to leave 
them out of our overall aesthetic assess­
ments. The suggestion to remove them is 
similar to a symphony companion say­
ing, "Don't worry about that foul smell or 
the machine-gun fire outside, just listen 
to the music." 

These ideas of natural salience and 
framing also provide a way to respond to 
Stan Godlovitch's argument against giv­
ing the human scale a special place when 
aesthetically appreciating nature.43 God­
lovitch contends that typical, human aes­
thetic responses to nature are "sensorily 
parochial" and that the temporal and spa­
tial scale-dependencies of our aesthetic 
responses to nature are arbitrary. He 
would have us aesthetically appreciate, 
presumably equally, all of nature, great 
and small, and all natural processes, long 
and short. Thus he argues that smashing 
ice blocks heaved up by a river is no less 
aesthetically offensive than bulldozing 
the Navaho sandstone castles of Monu­
ment Valley, Arizona. True, the ice melts 
each spring and reforms the following 
winter, but those monuments also will 
crumble and rise up again. "If we were gi­
ants, crushing a rock monument ... would 
be no more aesthetically offensive than 
flattening the odd sand castle is to us now. 
If our lives were measured in seconds, 
shattering ice blocks would count as mo­
mentously coarse as using Bryce Canyon 
as a landfill pit."44 

Such a view is clearly problematic for 
aesthetic protectionism. If environmental 
aesthetics is to be useful in environmental 
policy, it must be able to help us identify 
more or less aesthetically positive envi­
ronments or natural objects. It certainly 

cannot agree that as much aesthetic value 
is lost by crushing ice blocks in a river as 
by destroying thousand-feet-tall sand­
stone monuments. Note that the "equal 
beauty thesis" (that is, all of nature is 
equally beautiful)-although it is an ob­
jectivist claim-is a problem from the 
perspective of aesthetic protectionism. 
The fact that an environmental aesthetic 
is objective does not guarantee that it will 
be useful in environmental policy dis­
putes, and it does not ensure that it will be 
helpful to aesthetic protectionism. 

Godlovitch is right that our aesthetic 
experiences and judgments depend on 
scale (just as Budd and Fisher are right 
that what aesthetic properties we experi­
ence and what aesthetic judgments they 
support depend on how we frame our acts 
of nature appreciation). Hepburn illus­
trates this point: "The mountain that we 
appreciate for its majesty and stability is, 
on a different time-scale, as fluid as the 
ripples on the lake at its foot."45 But this 
should not make us think that the (scale­
dependent) aesthetic qualities we enjoy in 
the mountain cannot be appropriately ap­
preciated. Clear-cuts are a paradigm of 
environmental, aesthetic disvalue, but on 
a longer time scale, they are merely tem­
porary blips in an ongoing and aestheti­
cally exciting process of forest recovery. 
But this should not lead us to agree with 
the forest-industry executive that they are 
not ugly because we should adopt a time 
scale of two hundred years. 

My response to Godlovitch is that given 
the kind of creatures that we are and the 
temporal and spatial scales on which we 
operate, some dimensions of our framing 
choices are not arbitrary, and certain 
scales are more or less natural and appro­
priate. Simply because aesthetic qualities 
can be made to vanish and aesthetic 
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judgments undermined by taking a dif­
ferent perspective does not mean that 
these qualities do not exist and these 
judgments are inappropriate given the 
perspective we are taking. Nor should we 
believe that all perspectives are equally 
appropriate. Some framing of environ­
mental appreciation is awkward, forced, 
and myopic. Given the kind of beings we 
are and the legitimate purposes of aes­
thetic appreciation, some perspectives, 
scales, and framing choices-including 
Godlovitch's "any scale at all" and the an­
tienvironmentalists' demand to frame out 
human intrusions and to appreciate na­
ture from irrelevant or distorted scales­
are not acceptable 

The kind of aesthetic relativity that is 
most worrying to aesthetic protectionism 
may not be framing relativity but a rela­
tivity that affects our evaluation or judg­
ment of aesthetic value. Perhaps it is 
inappropriate to suppress the whine ofthe 
snowmobile, the buzz of the helicopter, 
and the silhouette of the Teton valley sky­
scraper from our environmental aesthetic 
evaluation. But motor enthusiasts may 
claim that they find these sounds appeal­
ing, and developers may claim to enjoy 
the sight of a large building silhouetted 
against the Grand Tetons, and they both 
may insist that environmentalists' intu­
itions about the negative aesthetic charac­
ter of these humanizations are just one 
aesthetic response, no more or less appro­
priate than the aesthetic responses of 
those who enjoy these human effects. 
Here is how a "wise-use" activist ex­
plained it: 

To elevate "natural quiet" to the status of a 
physical resource is ludicrous. Other sounds 
in the rest of the public land can be appre­
ciated, and must be acknowledged as a 

positive part of the experience. For exam­
pIe, I appreciate the sound of a chain saw. 
To hear a chain saw in the distance as I'm 
hiking along a trail warms my heart.46 

Fisher admits that he sometimes finds 
such relativity regarding the aesthetic 
value of natural sounds to be correct: "I 
may find the 'coo coo' sounds ofa flock of 
doves to be extremely harmonious and to 
express a soothing calm. A friend may 
find the same sound insistently obtru­
sive."47 He also provides evidence that 
suggests differences between city dwellers 
and others concerning how favorably or 
unfavorably they respond to animal 
sounds.48 A good case for the relativity of 
judgments of nature's aesthetic value can 
be found in J. A. Walter's "You'll Love the 
Rockies," an account in which this En­
glish visitor to the American West justi­
fies his "disappointment" with the 
Colorado Rockies.49 

I do not deny the possibility of some 
(perhaps even significant) relativity in 
aesthetic value judgments about nature. 
Differences in circumstances, contexts, 
and perspectives will motivate and per­
haps justify conflicting judgments about 
aesthetic properties and value. Perhaps 
the Grand Tetons will appear puny rather 
than majestic to someone who grew up in 
the Himalayas or comical to one contem­
plating the meaning of the French word 
teton. The sound ofan approaching snow­
mobile may well be soothing (rather than 
obnoxious) if one is lying hypothermic in 
the snow waiting for help or if one is the 
owner of a snowmobile rental business 
threatened by a proposed ban on snow­
mobiles in national parks. Clear-cuts may 
not be eyesores to those who hunt the deer 
feeding off the new growth or to the log­
gers who cut the trees. 
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I suspect that the right course here is to 
accept some plurality in environmental 
aesthetic evaluations and perhaps even 
some conflicting evaluations. Nonethe­
less, we should resist an anything-goes 
relativity concerning such evaluative re­
sponses. Finding criteria for evaluating 
better and worse evaluative responses 
should be our goal. For example, standing 
before the Grand Tetons for the first time 
and being amused by the thought that 
they look like breasts-although not "in­
correct," "false," or even necessarily "in­
appropriate"-is a worse response than, 
for example, being awed by their soaring 
height from the valley floor and imagin­
ing the geologic pressure necessary to cre­
ate them. 50 Along with multiple acceptable 
environmental aesthetic evaluations, we 
should acknowledge a number of unac­
ceptable evaluative responses. The nega­
tive aesthetic value judgment about 
swamps as bug-infested wastelands is a ste­
reotyped and ignorant aesthetic response 
that would be rejected by someone who 
knows something about swamps and is 
aware of the ecological services of wet­
lands and that because the water is mov­
ing, the bugs are not bad at all. Developers 
whose stereotypical view of swamps leads 
them to believe that putting a racetrack 
next to a swamp nature preserve is un­
problematic need not be taken seriously 
because their evaluation is founded on a 
misunderstanding of swamps. 

Resources for Objectivity and 
Aesthetic Protectionism 

I turn now from discussing doubts about 
objectivity in environmental appreciation 
to examining environmental aestheti­
cians' ideas that help with such objectiv­

ity and provide possible resources for 
aesthetic protectionism. The most impor­
tant of these ideas are (1) cognitive fac­
tors, (2) objectivity in emotional responses 
to nature, and (3) the disinterestedness of 
aesthetic responses. We expect accounts 
of objectivity from cognitivists like Carl­
son who base an appropriate appreciation 
of nature on an understanding of natural 
history. But we find such accounts as well 
in the work ofCarroll, who sees emotional 
responses as important to nature appreci­
ation and in the writings of Brady, for 
whom imagination, not knowledge, is 
central to appreciating nature. 

Cognitive factors, such as information 
about the objects of aesthetic attention 
and knowledge of appropriate categoriza­
tion, are the most obvious resource for 
constraining the plurality ofenvironmen­
tal aesthetic responses and helping us dis­
tinguish between better and worse 
responses. Carlson's scientific cognitivist 
account of environmental aesthetic ap­
preciation provides significant resources 
for objectivity, and his views overall are 
quite promising for aesthetic protection­
ism. Carlson's positive aesthetics for pris­
tine nature-"each natural thing, either 
with appropriate appreciation or at many, 
if not almost all, levels and conditions of 
observation, has substantial positive aes­
thetic value and little, if any negative aes­
thetic value"sl-provides strong grounds 
for aesthetic protectionism if we reject a 
similar positive aesthetics thesis for envi­
ronments shaped by humans (and it is 
plausible that we should). Carlson's reli­
ance on functionality for the aesthetic as­
sessment of humanized environments 
suggests that unsustainable human envi­
ronments have a negative aesthetic value. 52 

Because an environment's function is 
objective to a considerable extent, his 
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account of the aesthetic appreciation of 
human environments-although not 
based on natural science-has a dimen­
sion of objectivity as well. 53 

Not everyone agrees that cognitive fac­
tors are helpful in securing objectivity. 
Fisher argues that knowledge (at least of 
sounds) cannot playa significant con­
straining role. In response to Carlson's 
suggestion that "knowledge of the nature 
of the particular environments yields the 
appropriate boundaries of appreciations, 
the particular foci of aesthetic signifi­
cance, and the relevant acts of aspection 
for that type of environment,"54 Fisher 
maintains, "Knowledge will certainly af­
fect our experience and bring out features 
otherwise missed, but I do not think it 
can dictate frame or significance."55 In a 
similar vein, Budd contends that "catego­
ries of nature do not function to partially 
determine the real aesthetic properties of 
natural items as categories of art do those 
of works ofart."56 

I believe that in many cases, environ­
mental knowledge, including knowledge 
about the types of environmental items 
we are attempting to appreciate and 
knowledge of the environment more gen­
erally (including the extent of environ­
mental degradation), does and should 
influence appropriate frames and judg­
ments. Consider an example: While kaya­
king through a southern swamp, we can 
choose between listening to the sound of 
a woodpecker or that of an alligator. The 
possibility that one sound might be the 
call of an ivory-billed woodpecker, a bird 
thought extinct and whose existence has 
not been documented for forty years, sug­
gests that we should concentrate on the 
woodpecker hammering on a tree rather 
than the alligator bellowing. Here, both 
frame and significance-if not "dic­

tated"-are at least highly suggested by 
this bit of knowledge. In this case, having 
environmental knowledge enhances and 
deepens our aesthetic response, and lack­
ing such information can impoverish it. 

Sometimes identifying correct and in­
correc-t categories with which to appreci­
ate natural objects can help differentiate 
between appropriate and inappropriate 
aesthetic responses. Carlson uses examples 
to show that the correct categorization 
can-contrary to Budd's claims-deter­
mine the appropriate aesthetic properties 
of natural items: Is that a cute woodchuck 
or a massive, awe-inspiring rat? Is that an 
awkward deer or a graceful moose? Is that 
whale a clumsy fish or an impressive 
mammal? Deciding which aesthetic ad­
jectives are appropriate depends on plac­
ing the environmental object in its correct 
category.57 So, too, with perceptually in­
distinguishable environmental objects, 
one of which was manufactured by hu­
mans and the other ofwhich is natural: Is 
that a beautiful full moon rising over the 
hillside or an obnoxious satellite dish? Is 
that lime green creek an amazing work of 
nature or the revolting runoff from a 
mine? Sometimes the correct information 
and categorization does and should affect 
environmental aesthetic assessment. 58 

Both Carroll and Godlovitch reject the 
idea that aesthetic appreciation becomes 
inappropriate when it is based on false be­
liefs or mistaken scientific information. 
As Godlovitch stated, "Suppose your ap­
preciation of some natural phenomenon 
rested upon what turned out to be a false 
scientific theory. What do you suppose 
would happen? Would your appreciation 
be dimmed? Would you marvel the less? I 
certainly hope not."59 Carroll gives an ex­
ample of what he takes to be an appropri­
ate aesthetic response to a natural object 
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even when one holds false beliefs about it: 
"We may be excited by the grandeur of a 
blue whale. I may be moved by its size, its 
force, and the amount of water it dis­
places, etc., but I may think that it is a 
fish. Nevertheless my being moved by the 
grandeur of the blue whale is not inappro­
priate."6o I accept Carroll's example as an 
appropriate aesthetic response, but I think 
that the response remains appropriate 
only because the false belief does not in­
fluence it. If the false belief did influence 
the response, I think we would and should 
view the response as inappropriate, at 
least to the extent that the false belief and 
the response are related. Therefore, al­
though false beliefs about natural objects 
do not necessarily disqualify an aesthetic 
response to them, such responses are un­
dermined by the false beliefs that affect 
them. Once again, we see that knowledge 
and the correct categorization ofenviron­
mental objects can narrow the number of 
appropriate aesthetic responses. 

At the broadest level, I think a general 
knowledge of environmental degradation 
should inform environmental aesthetic 
appreciation. For example, a judgment 
about whether the trans-Alaska pipeline 
enhances or detracts from Alaska's beauty 
should be informed by knowledge of the 
environmental and social impacts of our 
society's oil addiction. In a world where 
human dominance over nature was not so 
extensive, perhaps the sounds of chain­
saws and other engine noises in wild areas 
should not be received as appalling. But in 
today's world, at least for those of us in­
formed and properly appreciative of the 
massive human impact on the planet, the 
appropriate response to these human in­
trusions into nature should not be posi­
tive. A positive aesthetic response to 
roadside litter, spewing sewage pipes, and 

fish floating belly-up in the creeks shows 
ignorance not only of the specific harms 
and the environmental vices manifested 
but also of the overall environmental deg­
radation that humans are causing. 

These conclusions depend on rejecting 
formalist and other narrow conceptions 
of aesthetic experience and judgment that 
isolate aesthetic appreciation. I reject such 
an aesthetic apartheid: Aesthetics is part 
of life, which means that aesthetics, eth­
ics, and cognition cannot be strictly 
separated.61 

A second resource for constraining en­
vironmental aesthetic pluralism is objec­
tivity concerning emotional responses to 
nature. Carroll sketches an argument for 
such emotional objectivity.62 Although he 
regards Carlson's environmental aesthet­
ics based on scientific knowledge as one 
type of appropriate appreciation of na­
ture, he criticizes Carlson's claim that it is 
the only type and offers his own "being 
moved by nature" as an additional and 
distinct mode of legitimate appreciation. 
Carroll argues that the visceral, mini­
mally intellectual, and emotional arousal 
of standing under a waterfall and being 
excited by its grandeur is an important 
and appropriate type ofaesthetic response 
to nature that is not based on a knowledge 
of natural history or science. Carroll 
agrees with Carlson on the need for ob­
jectivity in environmental aesthetics: 
"Any competing picture of nature appre­
ciation, if it is to be taken seriously, must 
have a comparable means to those of the 
natural environmental model for solving 
the problem of the objectivity of nature 
appreciation.''63 

Carroll argues that emotional arousal 
can be objective because emotional states 
mayor may not be appropriate, and ap­
propriateness is the truth (objectivity) of 
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emotions. Emotions are cognitive in that 
they are underpinned by beliefs, thoughts, 
and patterns of attention and are directed 
at objects. But emotions are appropriately 
directed at some objects and not others: 
The fear ofan oncoming tank is appropri­
ate, but the fear of chicken soup is not 
(unless one thinks it dangerous). Objec­
tive emotions are those that are appropri­
ate to their objects and whose underlying 
beliefs are reasonable for others to share. 
For example, being excited by the gran­
deur of something like the Tetons because 
they are huge is appropriate, and if this 
belief in their enormity is reasonable for 
others to hold, it is an objective emotional 
arousal (and not subjective, distorted, or 
wayward). The emotional response of 
people who are not excited by the gran­
deur of the Tetons-but who acknowl­
edge that they are huge-is inappropriate. 
If they deny the Tetons are huge because 
they are smaller than the Milky Way, then 
they have the wrong comparison class. 
Thus Carroll maintains that objectivity in 
environmental aesthetics is possible 
whether it is based on emotional arousal 
or scientific knowledge. 

I think Carroll is right that emotional 
reactions to nature can be more or less ap­
propriate, perceptive, wayward, or some­
times even downright inappropriate. Just 
it is inappropriate to be amused when a 
dog is hit by a car or to dance gaily to 
somber music, so it is inappropriate to be 
bored by a thundering waterfall crashing 
down on one's head or to respond posi­
tively to human intrusions into wild na­
ture. As I suggested earlier, those people 
who are well informed about humans' 
massive and harmful impact on the plan­
et's relatively natural areas and who have 
at heart the welfare of humans or nonhu­

mans react to environmental degradation 
with dismay. They do not find the hum 
of snowmobiles to be soothing. The 
sounds of chainsaws alarm them. Belch­
ing smokestacks disgust them, and col­
orful sunsets caused by pollution do not 
strike them as beautiful. In general, en­
vironmental degradation is not aestheti­
cally appealing to them. Those people 
who do find it appealing are likely to be 
ignorant of the human impact on the 
planet, have a skewed emotional consti­
tution, or have such strong self-interest 
as to blind their aesthetic response (or to 
disqualify it). I think Carroll's account 
gives us some of the tools needed to jus­
tify the claim that there are better and 
worse emotional aesthetic responses to 
nature. 

Emily Brady's imagination-based envi­
ronmental aesthetic, perhaps surprisingly, 
provides for objectivity in environmental 
appreciation, helps constrain the range of 
legitimate pluralism in environmental 
aesthetics, and offers resources for aes­
thetic protectionism.64 She focuses on the 
importance of imagination in aesthetic 
appreciation of nature and makes her case 
using many examples, such as this one: 

In contemplating the bark of a locust tree, 
visually, I see the deep clefts between the 
thick ridges of the bark. Images of moun­
tains and valleys come to mind, and I think 
of the age of the tree given the thickness of 
the ridges and how they are spaced apart. I 
walk around the tree, feeling the wide 
circumference of the bark. The image of a 
seasoned old man comes to mind, with 
deep wrinkles from age. These imaginings 
lead to an aesthetic judgment of the tree as 
stalwart, and I respect it as I might a wise 
old sage.6S 

428 

http:protectionism.64


OBJECTIVITY IN ENVIRONMENTAL AESTHETICS 

Brady is worried about imagination's 
reputation of being subjective and arbi­
trary. Many people believe that "imagi­
nation inevitably leads to an experience 
that is too unpredictable, too arbitrary 
and prone to fantasy to guide appropri­
ate aesthetic appreciation of nature."66 
For Brady, not every imaginative re­
sponse to nature is appropriate, and she 
attempts to "clip the wings of imagina­
tion" in hopes of retaining enough ob­
jectivity for environmental aesthetics to 
be useful to policy disputes. She rejects 
shallow, naive, and sentimental imagin­
ing responses that impoverish rather 
than enrich appreciation. Imagining a 
lamb dressed up in baby clothes might 
underline the aesthetic truth of inno­
cence, but it is sentimental and shallow 
and thus is not appropriate. Brady rules 
out other imaginings because they are ir­
relevant: We can be awestruck by an En­
glish cliff's dramatic drop to the sea, and 
this aesthetic response can be intensified 
by imagining the feeling of jumping off 
the cliff and the fear of someone contem­
plating jumping. But imagining the pos­
sible motives for jumping, such as 
financial difficulties, is not relevant to 
the aesthetic appreciation of that cliff 
and hence is not appropriate to its appre­
ciation. Brady also councils us to avoid 
imagination that instrumentalizes na­
ture, as when straying from an aesthetic 
focus in appreciation of a seascape by 
fantasizing about how many seashells we 
could collect if the waves were not so big. 
She argues that an aesthetic response 
must free the mind from self-interested 
and instrumental concerns, and thus 
imaginings and other thoughts that in­
strumentalize nature are not aestheti­
cally appropriate because they violate the 

disinterestedness requirement of the aes­
thetic response.67 

Brady's imagination-based theory of 
the aesthetic appreciation of nature is use­
ful for aesthetic protectionism in a num­
ber ofways. Her "critical pluralism," with 
its interpretation of aesthetic objectivity 
as involving judgments that are reason­
able, justifiable, and communicable, 
broadens the concept ofobjectivity in en­
vironmental aesthetics beyond scientific 
cognitivism and its focus on true and 
correct aesthetic judgments. Brady plau­
sibly rebuts the presumption that an 
imagination-based aesthetics of nature is 
purely subjective and arbitrary. She also 
partly rebuts Marcia Eaton's objection 
that there is no way of distinguishing ap­
propriate from inappropriate imaginings 
"without relying on the kind of cognitive 
model that Carlson insists upon."68 

Perhaps what is most useful for aes­
thetic protectionism is Brady's insistence 
that aesthetic appreciation be disinter­
ested, for it provides a mechanism for dis­
counting positive aesthetic responses to 
environmental degradation. She believes 
that disinterestedness requires freeing the 
mind from self-interested and instrumen­
tal attention to the aesthetic object. For 
example, ifwe react favorably to a play be­
cause we stand to make a lot of money 
from it, this is not an aesthetic response 
to the play, for it is not properly disinter­
ested. I submit that positive responses to 
environmental degradation are often self­
interested and thus not properly aesthetic. 
Clear-cuts may appear attractive to log­
gers or forestry executives. Snowmobiles 
in the wilderness may sound harmonious 
to someone for whom it means more busi­
ness or perhaps soothing to a person lying 
hurt and in need of evacuation. But such 
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responses are so infused with self-interest 
as to be disqualified from being (disinter­
ested) aesthetic responses. Many of the 
positive aesthetic responses to environ­
mental degradation are likely to be based 
on an instrumental and self-interested 
view of nature and thus, in Brady's inter­
pretation of disinterestedness, do not 
count as properly aesthetic. A "developer's 
aesthetic" that prefers Wal-Marts, shop­
ping malls, and strip highways to forests, 
wetlands, and the rural countryside may 
not be a legitimate aesthetic after all. 69 

I conclude this essay by assessing some 
of Marcia Eaton's claims about the 
superiority of cognitive approaches to en­
vironmental aesthetics for aesthetic pro­
tectionism. Eaton seems to have an 
instrumental view of environmental aes­
thetic appreciation that justifies an envi­
ronmental aesthetic response to the extent 
that it has positive implications for envi­
ronmental protection. Eaton clearly thinks 
that environmental aesthetics is crucial to 
environmental protection. "Ecologists in­
ternationally recognize that in the absence 
of a change in aesthetic preferences, sound 
environmental practices have little chance 
of being widely adopted."70 She provides 
the following example: "As long as people 
want large, green, closely mowed yards no 
matter what the climate or soil or water 
conditions, they will continue to use pol­
luting gasoline mowers and a toxic cocktail 
of fertilizers, herbicides and pesticides."71 
Presumably she believes that they would 
not find these lawns so aesthetically ap­
pealing if they considered their ecological 
consequences. Eaton identifies numerous 
other flawed environmental policies that 
are based on ecologically ignorant appre­
ciative responses. For example, she thinks 
it is partly because blackened forests strike 

people as ugly that we have had a policy to 
protect forests from fires, which has led to 
a decrease in-even a marginalization 
of-fire-adapted species and made our na­
tional forests into tinderboxes ready to 
explode. 

Eaton believes that if our goal for en­
vironmental aesthetics is "environmen­
tal sustainability" (and that is her goal), 
then Carlson's theory is what is needed: 
"The philosopher Allen Carlson has 
suggested a model of nature apprecia­
tion that is, in my opinion, the best so 
far presented if one's goal is to produce, 
protect or preserve environments that 
are both beautiful and healthy."72 Posi­
tive aesthetic responses to environments 
lead to care for them, but, Eaton insists, 
unless those responses are guided by en­
vironmental knowledge, the care may 
not be of the right sort. She criticizes 
Brady's reliance on imagination as the 
key to environmental aesthetics because 
unless such imagination (and the fiction 
that results from it) is informed and 
guided by environmental knowledge, the 
effect on nature of such an environmen­
tal aesthetic may be devastating. She then 
cites the Disney movie Bambi for encour­
aging a sentimental image of all deer as 
sweet, innocent, and gentle and notes 
that this image ignores the ecological 
devastation that deer can cause and has 
made it hard for forest managers to con­
vince the public of the need to reduce 
deer populations. Stories about swamp 
monsters have contributed to our nega­
tive aesthetic response to swamps and 
consequently to the massive loss of wet­
lands in this country. "As we have seen, 
fiction can sentimentalize and demon­
ize, with serious harm resulting. If sus­
tainable environments are our goal, then 
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fiction must be at the service of fact."?3 
"For only with knowledge will sustain­
able practices develop."74 Thus for Eaton, 
an account of environmental aesthetics 
like Carlson's-one solidly based on sci­
entific knowledge-is what we must seek 
if environmental aesthetics is to ground 
aesthetic protectionism. 

I agree that Carlson's environmental 
aesthetic offers positive resources for aes­
thetic protectionism, but I think Eaton is 
too quick to conclude that we must em­
brace Carlson's view. I also question her 
assumption that ecological knowledge al­
ways serves environmental goals. We have 
found resources for objectivity in envi­
ronmental aesthetics that are useful for 
aesthetic protectionism not only in Carl­
son's knowledge-based account but also 
in Carroll's emotion-based account and 
in Brady's imagination-based account. 
Eaton's view that only an environmental 
aesthetic informed by environmental 
knowledge can lead to sustainable care is 
insufficiently appreciative of these alter­
native accounts' value to aesthetic protec­
tionism. Eaton also fails to realize that a 
cognitive approach to environmental aes­
thetics can be a double-edged sword: In­
sisting that aesthetic responses to nature 
be informed by correct environmental 
knowledge can also lead to environmen­
tally harmful behavior. Some popular­
but fallacious-ecological ideas are 
environmentally beneficial. Many people 
believe in a delicate balance of nature, a 
tight integration of natural systems, and 
the dependence of stability on biodiver­
sity. But these ideas have been seriously 
challenged in contemporary ecological re­
search and are at best significantly over­
statedJ5 Nonetheless, such mistaken 
scientific beliefs seem beneficial to envi­

ron mental protection and policy. If we 
believe that driving a species to extinction 
will lead to ecological collapse, then we 
will preserve that species. If we see na­
ture as a delicate balance easily upset by 
human intrusion, then we will be in­
clined to avoid disrupting nature. Aes­
thetic responses based on ecological 
ignorance and myth may sometimes be 
the best for environmental protection, so 
ensuring that our aesthetic responses to 
nature are informed by scientific facts 
may not necessarily contribute to aes­
thetic protectionism. 

Conclusions 

Environmental aesthetics is important 
to environmental protection. Although 
they present significant worries for aes­
thetic protectionism, environmental aes­
thetic relativity and subjectivity do not 
cripple it. I have argued that we need to 
develop and justify accounts of better 
and worse aesthetic responses to the en­
vironment that avoid both an any thing­
goes relativism and the idea that only 
one type of environmental aesthetic re­
sponse is acceptable. Legitimate pluralism 
regarding environmental beauty does not 
prevent distinguishing between better 
and worse aesthetic responses. Environ­
mental aesthetics contains numerous re­
sources for objectivity that hold promise 
for justifying a significant role for judg­
ments of natural beauty in environmental 
protection. A knowledge-based environ­
mental aesthetic can be useful to aesthetic 
protectionism, but it is not the only use­
ful environmental aesthetic, and it does 
not guarantee beneficial environmental 
resultsJ6 
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